
  

 
ROTATION 

Spin; turning around an axis. 
 
 

 
 

 

 
GRAVITY 

A force that pulls objects toward each 
other. 

 

 

 

 
REVOLUTION 

Movement around another object. 
 

 

      

              

http://www.toptrix.net/2011/10/how-to-change-orientation-of-video.html
http://idahoptv.org/sciencetrek/topics/gravity/facts.cfm
http://www.first-learn.com/revolving-motion-of-the-earth.html


 
WEATHERING 

Process of rocks breaking down. 
 
 

 
 

 

 
EROSION 

Process of moving weathered rock. 

 

 

 

 
EVAPORATION 

Changing of a liquid into a gas. 

 

  

 
 

http://www.eschooltoday.com/rocks/what-is-physical-weathering-of-rocks.html
http://www.eschooltoday.com/rocks/erosion-and-transportation-of-rock-sediments.html
http://www.tigtagcarolina.com/film/separation-by-evaporation-PRM00347/


 
CONDENSATION  

Changing of a gas into a liquid. 

 

 

 
 

 
PRECIPITATION 

Water leaving the clouds and falling to 
Earth as rain, snow, sleet or hail. 

 

 

 
CLIMATE 

Average of all weather, through all 
seasons, of a region over a long period 

of time. 

 

 

http://citadel.sjfc.edu/students/kes00898/e-port/condensation%20page%20for%20unit.html
http://www.fondriest.com/news/precipitation.htm
https://en.wikipedia.org/wiki/Climate


 
HUMIDITY 

Amount of moisture in the air. 

 

 

 

 
REFLECTION  

Bounce back from a surface. 

 

 

 

 
REFRACTION  

Bending of a wave when it enters a 
different object. 

 

 

 

http://study.com/academy/lesson/relative-humidity-lesson-for-kids.html
https://www.britannica.com/science/reflection-physics
https://physics.stackexchange.com/questions/2169/why-does-light-refract-if-photons-are-not-bound-by-an-axle


 
ABSORB 

To take in. 

 

 

 

 
CONDUCTION 

Movement of heat between two objects 
that are touching. 

 

 

 
FRICTION 

A force that slows moving objects and it 
causes things to get hot. 

 

 

 

https://www.pinterest.com/darlingce/water-unit/
http://slides.com/arnav/conduction--2/fullscreen
https://plus.google.com/108594961350102381853


 
BALANCED FORCES 

Forces acting on an object are equal and 
opposite. 

 

 

 

 
UNBALANCED FORCES 

Forces acting on an object are not equal 
and opposite. 

 

 

 
POLLINATION 

Process of moving pollen to a plant for 
fertilization. 

 

 

 

https://vle.stroud-kes.org.uk/senior-school-1/year-6/science/forces-in-action
http://marshscience.blogspot.com/2014/12/what-are-forces.html
http://sciencewithme.com/learn-about-pollination/


 
FERTILIZATION 

Process of a sperm and egg cell joining 
together to make a seed. 

 

 

 

 
GERMINATION 

Process of sprouting/growing a plant 
from a seed. 

 

 

 
VERTIBRATES 

Animals with a backbone. 

 

 

 

http://www.biologyjunction.com/plant_reproduction.htm
http://www.cactus-art.biz/note-book/Dictionary/Dictionary_G/dictionary_germination.htm
https://www.britannica.com/list/5-vertebrate-groups


 
INVERTIBRATES 

An animal without a backbone. 

 

 

 

 
INHERIT 

Receive a trait from a parent by genes. 

 

 

 
PRODUCERS 

Living things that make their own food. 

 

 

 

http://kids.britannica.com/kids/article/invertebrate/437406
https://www.smore.com/b3xpb-inherited-or-learned
https://www.slideshare.net/Abu_Bakr_Shalaby/food-chains-44795269


 
CONSUMERS 

Living things that eat other living things. 

 
 
 

 

 
CARNIVORE 

A consumer who eats other animals. 

 

 

 

 
HERBIVORE 

A consumer who eats only plants. 

 

 

 

http://maggiesscienceconnection.weebly.com/habitats-food-chains--webs-trophic-pyramid.html
https://www.slideshare.net/veronicaestape/carnivores-herbivores-omnivores-with-examples
https://www.slideshare.net/veronicaestape/carnivores-herbivores-omnivores-with-examples


 
PITCH 

How high or low a sound is. 

 

 

 

 
VIBRATION 

A rapid back and forth movement that 
produces sound. 

 

 

 
ENERGY 

Ability to make something move or 
change. 

 

 

 

https://sites.google.com/site/pc4110kdh/pitch-and-volume
http://pondscienceinstitute.on-rev.com/svpwiki/tiki-index.php?page=sympathetic+vibration
http://news.mit.edu/2016/mit-energy-initiative-report-guidance-evolving-electric-power-sector-1215


 
SEDIMENTARY ROCK 

Rock formed when deposited sediment 
becomes cemented together. 

 
 
 

 

 
METAMORPHIC ROCK 

A rock that is changed by heat and 
pressure deep in the Earth. 

 

 

 

IGNEOUS ROCK  
Rock formed when magma or melted 

rock, cools and hardens. 

 

 

 

https://museumvictoria.com.au/melbournemuseum/discoverycentre/dynamic-earth/overview/sedimentary-environment/sedimentary-process/
http://mspagett.weebly.com/metamorphic-rocks.html
http://www.mnogolok.info/ewraiphoto-igneous-sedimentary-and-metamorphic-rocks-examples.htm


 
RENEWABLE RESOURCES 

A resource that can be replaced quickly. 

 

         

NONRENEWABLE 
RESOURCES 

A resource that is not replaced quickly. 

 

 

 
PHYSICAL CHANGE 

A change in matter in which a new 
substance is not formed. 

 

 
 

 

https://quizlet.com/128807358/test
http://www.differencebetween.info/difference-between-renewable-and-nonrenewable-resources
http://www.tutorvista.com/content/science/science-ii/chemical-reactions-equations/physical-change.php


CHEMICAL CHANGE 

A change in which one or more 
substances are changed into a new 

substance. 

 

 

 
METAORPHOSIS 

A major change in the form or structure 
of someone or something. 

 
 
 
 

 

 
OMNIVORE 

A consumer that eats both plants and 
animals. 

 

      

                     

https://www.slideshare.net/neenaharidas1/physical-chemical-change
http://www.burlingtongazette.ca/conservation-halton-is-going-through-a-metamorphosis-and-wants-to-hear-from-you-if-you-live-north-of-dundas-this-will-matter-to-you/
https://www.slideshare.net/veronicaestape/carnivores-herbivores-omnivores-with-examples


 
PREDATOR  

Consumer that hunts other animals for 
food. 

 

 
LARVA 

A small, wormlike stage in the life cycle 
of some insects. 

 
 
 
 

 

PUPA 

The stage in the life cycle of some 
insects when it changes from larva to an 

adult. 
 

 
 

 

https://www.dreamstime.com/stock-photo-set-predatory-animals-isolated-over-white-background-shade-image35856530
https://openclipart.org/detail/228566/caterpillar-2
https://en.wikipedia.org/wiki/Pupa


 
SEED DISPERSAL 

Movement of a seed from parent plant 
to a new location. 

 

 

 
LIVER 

An organ in the body that cleans your 
blood, stores energy, and produces a 

digestive liquid. 

 
 

 

 
INTESTINES 

An organ in the body where digestion 
and absorbtion of food occurs. 

 

 

 

http://study.com/academy/lesson/seed-dispersal-lesson-for-kids-facts-methods.html
http://www.webmd.com/cancer/ss/slideshow-liver-cancer-guide
http://www.tigtagcarolina.com/film/the-intestines-PRM00112/


 
PANCREAS 

A gland in the body that aids in 
digestion. 

 

 

 

KIDNEYS 

An organ that removes waste from the 
blood and forms urine. 

 

 
 

 

 
STAMEN 

Male organ of flowering plant that 
produces pollen. 

 

 
 

 

http://www.webmd.com/digestive-disorders/pancreas
http://www.edren.org/pages/edreninfo/normal-kidneys.php
https://www.wpclipart.com/plants/diagrams/plant_parts_2/stamen.png.html


 
PISTIL 

Female organ of flowering plant. 

 

 
 

 

 

MINERAL 

Any nonliving solid that has a crystal 
form. 

 

 
 

 
DISSOLVE 

To mix a dry ingredient with a liquid and 
it becomes part of the liquid. 

 

 

 

https://extension.illinois.edu/gpe/case4/c4facts1a.html
http://maggiesscienceconnection.weebly.com/minerals.html
http://rawrmaster.blogspot.com/2010/05/how-temperature-pressure-and-surface.html


 
VARIABLE 

An element that can be changed or 
adapted. 

 

 

 

CLOSED CIRCUIT 

An electric circuit through which a 
current can flow in an uninterrupted 

path. 

 

 

 
MIXTURE 

Combination of two or more substances 
that keep their identities. 

 

 
 
 

 

https://www.e-education.psu.edu/geog160/node/1882
https://www.autodesk.com/products/eagle/blog/what-is-electricity-explained-so-simply-even-your-mom-can-understand/
http://study.com/academy/lesson/mixtures-solutions-lesson-for-kids-definitions-examples.html


 
PLANT STRUCTURE 

Parts of the plant which have roles or 
functions. 

 
    

 

 

FUNCTION 

Is the role or “job” of plant part. 

 

 

 

MAMMAL CHARACTERISTICS 

Animals with fur or hair covering its 
body and lungs for breathing air. 

 

 

 

 
 

https://www.exploringnature.org/db/view/1956
http://mrsblacksstudentnews.weebly.com/structures-and-functions.html
http://animalia-life.club/mammals.html


REPTILE CHARACTERISTICS 

Animals with scales covering its body. 

 
 

AMPHIBIAN 
CHARACTERISTICS 

Animals with smooth, moist skin that 
starts life in water and moves to land. 

 

 

 
BIRD CHARACTERISTICS Have 

wings, feathers, beaks and lungs, and 
lays eggs. 

 

 
 

 

 

https://www.quora.com/What-are-the-existing-10-types-of-reptiles
http://www.cms.qld.edu.au/students/amphibians-class
https://www.petfinder.com/pet-adoption/other-pet-adoption/bird-lifespans/

